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Infant mortality rates vary around the world. In 19th 
century, the infant mortality rate decreased by half as the 
number of physicians increased by four folds. Infant 
mortality will reduce by 30% with the addition of one 
physician to every 1000 persons in a population. Child 
mortality is not only caused by infection and disorder but 
also caused by premature birth, birth defect, new-born 
infection, birth complication, and disease like malaria, 
sepsis and diarrhea.The theme of this Pediatrics 
Conferences is kept as “Current Trends and Advancements 
in Neonatology & Pediatric Care”. A scientific and advisory 
committee will ensure a highly interactive, scientifically 
simulative and intensive program for the conference. 
Pediatrics Conferences provide you a huge platform to 
gain and share your knowledge about the Pediatrics, 
Neonatology, Primary Care and Health Care. 

 
Clinical Pediatrics is a restorative diary that takes to 

distribute and to access information on a change of tyke 

focus mind points alongside those of a logical, instructive, 

behavioral, clinical or ethical nature. Clinical Pediatrics in 

this Pediatric Conferences sensitivity is likewise a standout 

amongst the most vital and generally considered territories 

in novel research of this field. 

Pediatric allergy is a crucial subject to be learnt to promote 

knowledge and enhance the treatment of respiration, 

allergic, and immunologic diseases in youngsters. 

according to the epidemiologic research the common 

chronic illnesses of children—asthma and allergies as well 

as many rare diseases and uncommon diseases. 

Neonatal Nursing normally encompasses care for those 
toddlers who experience problems quickly after birth; yet 
it additionally consists care for toddlers who experience 
long-time period problems associated with their infection 
or prematurity after birth. Advancements in Neonatal 
surgery, anesthesia, and intensive care unit have 
enhanced the result for neonates with consolidated 
surgical conditions as well as for those preterm new-born 
kids with consolidated medicinal and surgical issues. 

Pediatric nutrition is the maintenance of a proper well-
balanced food plan consisting of the essential vitamins 
and the adequate caloric intake necessary to promote 
increase and maintain the physiologic requirements on 

the various stages of a child's development. 

 

Despite recent advances in neonatal intensive therapy, 
still is present significant morbidity associated with 
extreme prematurity that includes both short-term and 
long-term pulmonary, neurologic and visual impairments. 
These complications of prematurity not only affect the 
quality of life of these children in the rest of their lives, 
but can also cause numerous medical and economic 
burdens in the society. No single therapy has proven to be 
effective in preventing or treating developmental lung, 
brain and retinal injuries in preterm infants or the 
hypoxic-ischemic brain injury in full-term infants. Dr. 
Brankica Vasiljevic explained Stem cell based therapy in 
neonates. 

 

 

 

 

 
The elaborated information were discussed in 22nd Global 

Summit on Pediatrics, Neonatology & Primary Care. With 

the response of our present conference, we are 
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announcing our next series “23rd World Congress on 

Global Summit on Pediatrics, Neonatology & Primary Care” 

to be held during April 27-28, 2020 in Dubai, UAE. 
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